
$639,000 - 1033 WEST WHITES Road
 

Listing ID: 40476829

$639,000
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 0.77 acres
Single Family

1033 WEST WHITES Road, Port Carling,
Ontario, P0B1J0

Tranquility in the heart of Muskoka Lakes,
merely minutes to both Port Carling and
Bala. This 3 bedroom delightful home is
perfectly tucked away across from the
shores of Butterfly Lake. It is surrounded by
the most peaceful yard you could dream of.
Shaded by hearty mature trees and an
embellished with an abundance of gorgeous
annual gardens. The out of doors is
equipped with a full sized shed and a green
house, in addition to the oversized attached
garage with shelving for storage and a
workbench. Inside you will find the main
level and open concept living, which is ideal
for entertaining, relaxing, or being able to
keep an eye on the little ones from almost
any room. The spacious primary bedroom is
equipped with a private full bathroom and is
easily accessed from the main living area. A
large office space can be used as is, or
converted to suit various needs. This
offering is a location that many local
residents seek out, and it will be enjoyed to
the fullest in every seasons. Make your
appointment to view this special property
today! (id:49587)
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