
$399,999 - 1571 NORTH MARY LAKE Road
 

Listing ID: 40474283

$399,999
, 1 Bathrooms, 0.45 acres
Single Family

1571 NORTH MARY LAKE Road,
Huntsville, Ontario, P1H1A1

It doesn't get more authentic than this!
Welcome to your own little, red, 3 season
cabin in the woods! Private but not isolated.
Just steps to Mary Lake public boat launch
and swim area. Put your boat in for all day
enjoyment and take it out in the evening and
park it on your lot just meters away. Less
than 10 mins to downtown Huntsville!
Stunning views of Mary Lake from the
granite rock cut behind the cabin. Rocks
continue to give privacy along the west side
of the property where North Mary Lake
Road is. Enjoy a campfire between the cabin
and new outhouse for ease of use. A brand
new deck welcomes you as you approach
the cabin. Inside you will take a trip back in
time with the rustic ambiance of real wood,
picture frame windows, an eat-in kitchen
and newly tiled shower. Toilet is
composting and a back up cistern for water
sits behind the cabin. Canoe or kayak to
Muskoka Bible Conference just left of the
boat launch. Cliff jumping, Port Sydney
Beach & rapids, and Zanetti's General Store
for ice cream are all a short boat ride away.
Mary Lake is a desirable area and this
property won't last long! (id:49587)
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$399,999 - 1571 NORTH MARY LAKE Road
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