
$26,000 - 1869 MUSKOKA 118 ROAD W Unit# E215-D2
 

Listing ID: 40415937

$26,000
1 Bedrooms, 1 Bathrooms, 288
Single Family

1869 MUSKOKA 118 ROAD W Unit#
E215-D2, Muskoka Lakes, Ontario,
P1L1W8

Generously sized modern studio suite in the
Main Lodge with ample space to relax and
have the perfect retreat to enjoy
maintenance free cottaging. This 1/8th
fraction allows you to experience the best of
Muskoka for 6 weeks a year and is ideally
located between Bracebridge and Port
Carling. This unit is part of Touchstone
Resort on Lake Muskoka with access to all
of the resort amenities including dining on
the patio, Touch spa, fitness room, infinity
pool/hot tub, tennis courts, beach and non-
motorized water toys as well as an
additional pool/hot tub at the beach and the
perfect base to discover Muskoka. Week
schedule is Friday-Friday. This is NOT a pet
friendly unit. This year's bonus week for
fraction D2 is Thanksgiving!!! Don't miss
out!! Motivated Seller. (id:49587)
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